Enclosure C-3-c
March 14, 2016

Worthington City Schools
200 E. Wilson Bridge Road
Worthington Estates School Roof Replacement
Architectural Bid Package No. : 38

Bid Tabulation
Received February 29, 2016

@ 12:00 Noon

Contractor Bi‘:::/a:":ty Addendum 1 Base bid ALT 1-1 ALT 1-2 ALT 1-3
Damschroder Roofing Yes Yes $136,341.00 $2,600.00 $3,400.00 NO BID
ASI Yes Yes $142,500.00 $5,000.00 $6,500.00 $75,000.00
DIV. 7 Yes Yes $157,000.00 $8,500.00 $4,500.00 NO BID
K&W Yes Yes $159,300.00 $4,500.00 $7,500.00| $100,000.00
Meade Construction Yes Yes NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Chemcote Yes Yes $182,000.00 | $20,000.00| $45,000.00 $50,000.00
Phinney Yes Yes NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Witnessed By: Worthington City School District

Date:

CTL Engineering, Inc.

Date:




Worthington City Schools
200 E. Wilson Bridge Road
Sutter Park Elementary School Roof Replacement
Architectural Bid Package No. : 38

Bid Tabulation
Received February 29, 2016

@ 12:00 Noon

Contractor Biifs“/aﬁ:ty Addendum 1 Base bid ALT 1-1 ALT 1-2 ALT 1-3
Damschroder Roofing Yes Yes $587,901.00 $2,600.00 NO BID NO BID
ASI Yes Yes $762,500.00 $5,000.00 $4,850.00 $75,000.00
DIV. 7 Yes Yes NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
K&W Yes Yes $884,750.00 $4,500.00 | $45,125.00| $178,500.00
Meade Yes Yes $893,500.00 $1,500.00 | $45,000.00| $100,000.00
Chemcote Yes Yes $915,139.00 | $20,000.00 NO BID $90,000.00
Phinney Yes Yes NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Witnessed By: Worthington City School District

CTL Engineering, Inc.

Date:

Date:




Worthington City Schools
200 E. Wilson Bridge Road
Liberty Elementary School Roof Replacement

Architectural Bid Package No. : 38

Received February 29, 2016

Bid Tabulation

@ 12:00 Noon
Bid . .
Contractor Guaranty Addendum | Addendum Base bid ALT 2-1 ALT 2-2 Combmt?d Bid ALT 3-1
1 2 Sutter/Liberty
Yes / No

Damschroder | ¢ Yes Yes $603,268.00| NO BID NO BID $1191,169.00 | NO BID
Roofing
ASI Yes Yes Yes $741,000.00 | $40,000.00| $75,000.00| $1,500,000.00 | $170,000.00
DIV. 7 Yes Yes Yes $587,700.00 | $65,500.00| NOBID NO BID NO BID
K&W Yes Yes Yes $772,650.00 | $85,000.00 | $178,500.00 | $1,657,400.00 | $357,000.00
Meade Yes Yes Yes $803,200.00 | $50,000.00 | $100,000.00 | $1,696,700.00 | $200,000.00
Chemcote Yes Yes Yes $798,800.00 | NO BID $90,000.00 | $1,713,000.00 | $175,000.00
Phinney Yes Yes Yes $785,000.00 | $56,000.00 | $65,000.00 NO BID NO BID

Witnessed By: Worthington City School District

Date:

CTL Engineering, Inc.

Date:






